MADISON COUNTY
CDBG REQUISITION FORM

REQUISITION NUMBER: 4

PROJECT NUMBER: 1129-12-045-PF-01

DATE: _ DECEMBER 16, 2013 BANK ACCOUNT NUMBER:

SUNCOAST INFRASTRUCTURE INC

WARNOCK & ASSOCIATES

$34,851.89 (520,353.50 LOCAL
$14,498.39 CDBG)

$10,500.00 (54,830.00 LOCAL
$5,670.00 CDBG)

APPROVED:

BY

BOARD PRESIDENT



PERIODIC TSTIMATE FOR PARTIAL PAYMENT

Project No. |Contract No,

13074 |CDBG No. 1129-12-045-PF-0)

Nade ol Project
[Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation Project
Madison County, VS

Periodic Esiimate Number

T

Lovation nf Prgject

Flora, Mississippt

Fstimate Peond

From : 928/2013 To: 1072572013

None & Addvess of Owner

Madison County Board of Supervisors
c/o Warneck and Associates, LLC
158 West Center Slieet

Canton, MS 20046

SCHEDULE OF CONTRACT €

buen cone under anG or more soth orders

(Listevery chunge oraer sssued (o date of dis request even il un wors, hus

Namit: and Address of Cantractoz

Suncoast [nfrastructure, Inc,
P.O. Box 597
Florence. Ms 39073

ANGT, ORDERS

Contract N
Change Order Additioins To Contract Deductivys From
Price As Shown un Canrract Price As ShownOn
NO. Dute Deseription Change Qrder Change Order
M ) ) () (5)
1 10421743 [Additional Rout Removal, Re-Setups 85,761.25
(- - —
Totals $5.761.25 $0.00
ANALYSIS OF ADJUSTED CONTRACT AMOUNT TO DATE
fa) ORINGINAL CONTRACT AMOUNT .. 1uiveesieiinssnnsssnssnssnssssiescerssieesisivans sasnes S301207.0C
{b) PLUS: ADTHTIONS SCHEDULED (N COLUMN 4 ABOVE. .. ... ... 55,761.25
) EDUCTIONS SCHEDULED IN COLUMN 5 ABOVE, . Joon
id)y ADIUSTED CONTRACT AMOUNT TO DATE...... civeie svnssvmnrensionisns S306,068.25

ANATYSIS OF WORK PERFORMED 10 DATE

@ COST UF DRIGINAL CONTRAL™ WORK PERFORMED TC DA7E
Q) EXTRA WORK PERFORMER TO DATT By ¢

() TOTAL COST OF WORK PERFORMUD TO DATE, .. -

() ADD: MATERIALS STORED AT CLOSE OF PERIOD . R 3000

16} SUBTOTAL OF (c) aud (d)un ... S66:41FG &

M LESS: RLIAINAGL (3% e oo oo p 8332080y = &

(g) SUBTOTAL OF (c¢) and ¢, “SE3;09G:5% i) £3,60

) LESS: AMOURT OF PREVIOUS ESTIM B S2824269 o
() AMOUNT DUE THIS ESTIMATE oo roersoes s sttt oo ~§34854-05— b 3, FELEY
)

CERTIFICATE OF CONTRACTOR
According 1o the heat af my knawledge snd belief, 1 eatily shat ail
itenis and amounts shown in thie Periodie Estimate for Parial Pavment
are correet; tat all work has been performee and »o1 dndy wathernzed
tituiiony, Wierations and/pr addilions: tha:
foregoing is wel stalement ol the Contract acenunt up la
and including the vdic
Lstinate; and Ihat ac pert of the “Amouat Doe This Estimase” has been

the

deviations

atrae 2l e
t day of the periad covered Ly the 17

reeeived,

Suncoast Inlrastructure, ne.
(Contrfusor)

o -
By el S TN £
AR
Tide: __Project Mannger
]
oae.__ U412
! i

RECOMMENDATION OF ENGINEER
Tiris Periodic Eztimaiz for Partial Payment covers all pay item wark
performed by the cont'actor fhrough the catimate period siated hereon.
The undersigned recommends payment of the amoual on line (1) sbove
subjeet ta this provisions of the Contract Documents cover ng L repan
or replacernen: of all dalizctive wodk, iFany, that mzy be discavered
prios (o dnal payment or sxpirazion of the zencral puaranty poriod

Byr

q&muh.ﬂ_...h
i & e
_ EAMGINSER

Tile,

[2.- 9=~ 20)3

Date:

RE SR
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Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Lon Burt" <lonburt@warnockandassociates.com>
Date: December 9, 2013 at 12:03:.07 PM CST

To: "Woody Sample" <woody@samplehicks.com>
Subject: W. Madison Pay RequestNo. 3

Mr. Sanple,
Please see the attached Pay Request.

We had 0 make some changes on this pay request (as shown in red) due to the “Re-se¢ tup of TV” pay
iem quantity exceeding the Change Order No. 2 amount by 3 Each. Please let me know if you have any
questions.

Thanks.

Lon Burt (EI)
Project Engineer

Warnock & Associates, LLC
158 W. Center Street
Canton, MS 39046

Office: (601) 855-2250)
Fax: (601) 855-2599

Cell: (601) 527-3780

Email: Jonburiee warmochandassogintcs.com




WARNOCK & ASSOCIATES, LLC

ENGINEERING, MANAGEMENT & PLANNING

DECEMBER 9, 2013

WEST MADISON UTILITY DISTRICT
443 LIVINGSTON VERNON ROAD
FLORA, MS 39071

RE: 2013 SEWER REHABILITATION

INVOICE 121613

DESCRIPTION:
* CONSTRUCTION ENGINEERING FEE...ee e sumssssmannica$15,000,00
¢ CONSTRUCTION ENGINEERING @ 70 % COMPLETE......................$10.500.00
» CONSTRUCTION ENGINEERING FEE PAID TO DATE. oo $0.00
TOTAL DUE................... AEEETS ST PN ceareann ..-$10,500.00

SINCERELY.

1

WARNOCK & ASSOCIATES, LLC

RUDY M. WARNOCK;
PRESIDENT

CC: SHELTON VANCE, COMPTROLLER, MADISON COUNTY

“DEDICATED TO EXCELLENCE IN ENGIN

EERING”

158 W, CENTER STREET
CANTON. MS 39046
601-855-2250 PHONE
601-855-2599 Fax

www.warnockandassociates.com




